Category A - American Sign Language Interpretation

Sunbelt Staffing $ 62.00 12 1316 $ 979,104.00 $ 62.00 4 100 $  24,800.00
Interpreters Unlimited $ 65.00 12 1316 $ 1,026,480.00 No Bid

Maldon Language Interpreters Inc. $ 70.00 12 1316 $ 1,105,440.00 No Bid

Sign Language USA $ 73.00 12 1316 $ 1,152,816.00 No Bid

All World Language Consultant Inc. $ 73.50 12 1316 $ 1,160,712.00 $ 75.00 4 100 $ 30,000.00
Context Global Inc. $ 74.00 12 1316 $ 1,168,608.00 No Bid

HIS Sign LLC $ 76.50 12 1316 $ 1,208,088.00 $ 76.50 4 100 $ 30,600.00
Graham Staffing Services Inc. $ 77.00 12 1316 $ 1,215,984.00 No Bid

ASL Interpreters Inc. $ 7750 12 1316 $ 1,223,880.00

Sign Language Professionals Inc. $ 79.50 12 1316 $ 1,255,464.00 $ 8150 4 100 $ 32,600.00
Purple Communications $ 89.00 12 1316 $ 1,405,488.00

Allied Instructional Services $ 90.00 12 1316 $ 1,421,280.00

Cobb Pediatric Group dba The Stepping Stones Group Non-responsive Bid No Bid

Prepared By: Joshua A. Makely, CPPO, CPPB



